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How to make a Balearic sling

Figure5:Thefinishedknee.
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6Splitpouch
Currently,thestrandsemergingfromthekneeare
halfasthickasthestrandsintheretentioncord.To
increasetheirthicknessagain,additionalstringsare
addeddirectlyaftertheknee.Ifyouwouldleavethe
pouchhalvesthatthin,thepouchwouldbetoolight
comparedtothecordsandtheslingwouldnotre-
leasewell.Ontheotherhand,ifyouaddedthesead-
ditionalstringsbeforetheknee,thetransitionfrom
theretentioncordtothepouchwouldbetoostiffand
causetheslingtoreleasepoorlyaswell.

First,preparetheadditionalstrings.Theyshouldbe
aslongasthestringswhichemergefromtheknee.
Youneedasmanyadditionalstringsastherearein
theretentioncord.Onceyouhavecutthem,take
halfofthestringsandputthemnexttoyou.Unbraid
thestrandsoftheleftpouchhalfuptothekneeand
pullthemtightoncemore.Now,asyoubraidthese
strandsagain,addoneoftheadditionalstringstothe
excessstrandofeachR-configurationbeforetwisting
andfoldingthemovertogether.Takeyourtimewith
this,andmakesuretopulleverytingtight.
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The fourth issue of Khermadion shows how to braid
a Balearic-style sling.

10 Waxing
Slings braided from plant fibers which easily absorb
moisture benefit greatly from beingwaxed afterwards.
This improves the sling’s resistance towater and abra-
sion, at the cost of an increased weight.

To wax a sling, take a lump of bees wax and heat it
briefly over a candle. Brush the soft wax on the sling
and repeat this until the entire sling is covered with
a layer of wax. Loosely coil the sling up and put it
into a clean, heat resistant bowl. Now gently heat
it using a heat gun or a baking oven set to 70 ◦C to
80 ◦C. Wait until the molten wax has soaked into the
sling’s fibers. Remove the sling from the bowl and let
it cool down. Then thoroughly flex the sling back and
forth to reduce its stiffness. With use, the sling will
slowly get more pliable.
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5Knee
Whenbeginningtheknee,wheretheretentioncord
splitsintothetwohalvesofthesplitpouch,thestrands
ofyourretentioncordshouldbeintheR-configura-
tion.Dividethestringsofeachstrandintwogroups
ofequalsizeandfoldtheresultingtenstrandsover
eachotheraccordingtothefollowingpattern,each
timetwistingandpullingthemtightbeforehand.

PutK1overK2–K6betweenK6andK7
PutK10overK6–K9betweenK5andK6
PutK2overK3–K6betweenK6andK7
PutK8overK4–K7betweenK2andK3
PutK4overK5–K8betweenK8andK9
PutK10overK8–K9betweenK7andK8

Ineachofthesesteps,K1referstothefirststrand
fromtheright,K2tothesecond,andsoon.

Afteryouhavefollowedthesesteps,thestrandsK1–
K5andK6–K10willeachlieintheR-configuration.
Clamptheright-handstrandsK1–K5withaclothes-
pinandbraidtheleft-handstrandsK6–K10fora
fewcentimeters.Fixthelooseendwithashortpiece
ofstringandthendothesamewiththeright-hand
strands.Figure5showsthefinishedknee.
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Afteryouhaveaddedalloftheadditionalstrings,
continuetobraidthepouchhalfuntilyouhavereached
thedesiredlengthofyourpouch.About12cmto
14cmaresuitableformostprojectilesizes.Fixthe
endofthebraid,whichshouldbeintheL-configuration,
withaclothespin,andlayitaside.Figure6showsthe
finishedlefthalfofthepouch.

Figure6:Theleftpouchhalf.
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(a) (b)

Figure 11: (a) The release cord ending in a tassel of
loose fibers. (b) A replaceable cracker attached to a
loop at the end of the release cord.
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(a)(b)

Figure4:(a)Thebraidedsectionwhichformsthefin-
gerloop.(b)Thefinishedfingerloop.
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Now,repeatthisprocesswiththestrandsemerging
fromtheright-handsideoftheknee.Again,always
addanadditionalstringtoR1ofeachR-configuration
untilthebraidisasthickastheretentioncordand
continueuntilithasreachedthesamelengthasthe
leftpouchhalf.Figure7showsthefinishedpouch
halves.

Figure7:Thefinishedpouchhalves.
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1 Introduction
Slinging has a long tradition on the Balearic Islands,
and Balearic slings are among the finest types of slings.
They are typically made out of loose esparto or sisal
fibers, braided in one go from the finger loop to the
cracker. Their cords have a rectangular cross-section
and the resulting lateral stiffness offers great control
over the pouch orientation during the throw, without
impeding the release. The transition from the reten-
tion cord to the split pouch, often called the knee,
is flexible, allowing the pouch to unfold more eas-
ily. In contrast to this, the transition from the pouch
to the release cord, called the belly, is thicker and
more rigid. This asymmetric weight distribution ad-
ditionally improves the sling’s release. The tapered
release cord finally ends in a tassel of loose fibers, the
cracker. Often, thin pieces of leather are sewn on the
finger loop and on the split pouch, to make the for-
mer more comfortable and to protect the latter from
abrasion. Figure 1 shows the structure of a Balearic
sling.
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9 Cracker
Traditionally, to finish the release cord, the strands
are tied off closely behind the point where you pinch
the release cord when holding the sling. The loose
strands are then shortened to about a hand’s width
and produce a loud crack when slinging.

Nowadays, often synthetic fibers are braided into the
end of the release cord, so that they gradually replace
the natural fibers the sling is made of predominantly.
This increases the cracker’s lifespan, as it is subjected
to high stress. Nevertheless, it has to be replaced
eventually by unbraiding the release cord, removing
the worn fibers and inserting new ones step by step.

When braiding a Balearic-style sling from strings in-
stead of loose fibers, a better option is to create a
small knot or loop at the end of the release cord. This
allows to attach a separate, replaceable cracker.
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4Fingerloopandretentioncord
Wraponehalfoftheyarnbundlearoundyourfoot,
forexample,sothatyoucanexertforceonthestrands
whenbraiding.Sortthestringsoftheotherhalfinto
fivestrandsandstartbraiding,beginningintheR-
configuration.Continueuntilyourbraidisabout10cm
long,sothatitlooslyfitsaroundyourmiddlefinger.
ItshouldendintheR-configuration,asshowninfig-
ure4(a).Temporarilyfixtheopenendofthebraid
usingaclothespinorashortpieceofstring.Next,re-
movetheotherhalfoftheyarnbundlefromyourfoot
andloosenthetieyoumadetobundlethestrings.
Formthefingerloopbythreadingthebraidedsection
throughaloopofstrongcordfixede.g.toyourfoot
andmergethecorrespondingstrandsofbothends.
Noweachstrandwillhavetwiceasmanystringsas
before.Carefullypullthestrandstightasyoubraid
thefirstfewstepsoftheretentioncord,asportrayed
infigure4(b).Afterthat,continuetobraidthereten-
tioncorduntilitisaslongasthefinalslingshallbe,
lessthelengthofthefingerloopandhalfthelength
ofthepouch.
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7Belly
Tojoinbothpouchhalves,spreadtheirstrandsout
andgroupthemsothatthecorrespondingstrandsof
bothhalveslienexttoeachother.Thefivepairsof
strandshavetobeorderedinsuchawaythattheylie
inseperatelayersontopofeachother.PutL3ontop,
followedbyL4,L2,L5andfinallyL1.Takecarethat
thebraidsofthepouchhalvesdon’tloosenuptoo
muchintheprocess.Figure8showstheproperly
sortedstrands.Continuetobraidwiththemerged
strandstwistingandpullingthemtightcarefullyat
eachstep.
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Knee Tapered release cord

BellySplit pouch Cracker

Figure 1: Characteristic features of a Balearic sling.

Instead of braiding with loose fibers, a Balearic-style
sling can also be made from strings, as the follow-
ing instructions will show. The manufacuring pro-
cess is largely the same, but especially when first get-
ting startedwith braiding, using yarn instead of loose
fibers is much easier.

2

Figure 10: Tapering of the release cord.
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3Yarnpreparation
Tobeginthesling,youwillneedfivestrandswhich
eachconsistofatleasttwostrings.Thecombined
weightofonestrandshouldliewithin1g/mto3g/m.

Figure3:Fivestrandsof
yarn,tiedtogethertobe-
ginthebraid.

Thelengthofeachstring
shouldequalsixtimes
thefinallengthofthe
sling,fromfingerloop
tothecenterofthe
pouch.Manynatu-
ralmaterialssuchas
linen,hempandcot-
tonyarnarewellsuited
forbraidingaBalearic-
stylesling.

Onceyouhavecutthe
stringstolength,bun-
dlethemandtiethem
togetherinthemiddle
usingashortpieceof
string,asshowninfig-
ure3.
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Figure8:Orderingofthestrandsforjoiningthe
pouchhalves.
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2 Herringbone braid
Balearic slings are braided with an odd number of
strands in a herringbone pattern. The following in-
structions assume five strands. Themore strands you
use, the finer the resulting braid is, and the more pro-
nounced its lateral stiffness becomes. On the other
hand, more strands are more complicated to work
with and require more time for the same length of
braid. In general, five strands are a good compro-
mise, especially for beginners.

When making a herringbone braid, the ordering of
the strands alternates between two basic configura-
tions. In both configurations, the strands are sepa-
rated in two groups, with one group having exactly
one strand more than the other. Both configurations
are mirror images of each other, and by folding the
excess strand over all other strands in its group to
the inside of the other group, one configuration is
changed into the other and the braid progresses. Fig-
ure 2 shows one of these two configurations for five
strands, and how the excess strand is folded to change
into the other configuration. Depending on the side
onwhich the excess strand lies, the following instruc-
tions refer to the two configurations as L-configura-
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8 Release cord
Braid the belly for a few centimeters. To taper the re-
lease cord, drop a single string from the excess strand
R1 every n R-configurations. Lay it aside each time
and fold the strand over without the dropped strand.
As long as n is not divisible by the number of strands
you are braiding with, or vice-versa, the thicknesses
of the strands will decrease evenly. Initially, drop
strands more quickly, i.e. every one or two braid-
ing steps, and then continuously increase n so that
the rate at which the release cord tapers does not
change abruptly. When the release cord has gotten
slightly thinner than the retention cord, continue to
braid without dropping further strings until the re-
lease cord has reached its desired length. In general,
the release cord should taper quickly enough so that
it is lighter overall than the retention cord overall.
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tion,wheretheexcessstrandisontheleft,andR-
configuration,wheretheexcessstrandisontheright.
Tofurtherfacilitatetheiridentification,theindivid-
ualstrandsarenumberedL1–L5andR1–R5,re-
spectively,startingfromtheexcessstrand.

Beforefoldingovertheexcessstrand,alwayspullit
tightandtwistitoutwards,sothattheuppersideof
thestrandrotatesawayfromyou.Thenfolditover
thesecondandthirdstrandtotheotherhalf.

Figure2:Structureofafivestrandherringbonebraid.
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Figure9:Thefinishedbelly.
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